






CERTIFICATE
OF ACHIEVEMENT

RUPA BOHRA

Managing director

TNS India Foundation

This certificate is presented to

Aakriti
from Abstract Constructors team for actively participating and winning  Runner Up

position in the tech competition 'The Coding Rangers' conducted on the occasion of

'The National Youth Day' - 12th January 2023.

We wish you all the best for your future endeavors.
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Rekha N <rekhan@ksit.edu.in>

Fwd: Regarding Chapter Growth Fund
1 message

Bhargavi Ananth <bhargavi_ananth@ieee.org> Thu, Aug 24, 2023 at 3:52 PM
To: "rekhan@ksit.edu.in" <rekhan@ksit.edu.in>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Theresa Argiropoulos <t.argiropoulos@ieee.org>
Date: Thu, Feb 16, 2023 at 12:45 AM
Subject: Re: Regarding Chapter Growth Fund
To: Bhargavi Ananth <bhargavi_ananth@ieee.org>
Cc: George Olekson <g.olekson@ieee.org>, Theresa Argiropoulos <t.argiropoulos@ieee.org>

Dear Bhargavi,

Thank you for sharing the additional details for the budget request.  I have reviewed the information and I am fine with the
proposed plan. The Society will support the Student Branch Chapter up to the $500 limit.  George will process the funding
request.  

After the events, you are expected to provide receipts for all expensess in a timely fashion.   For prizes, honorariums, and
travel support provided to individuals, please document the event name and date, recipient names, amount awarded to
each individual, and member number and submit that information with your expenses.  Any continued funding for the
following year will be contingent on the Student Branch Chapter having properly submitted receipts for the prior year. 

Student Branch Chapters must also write a small summary of the event so that it can be featured in the SPS Newsletter. 
 Let me know if you have any further questions.

Regards,
-Theresa
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On Sat, Feb 11, 2023 at 12:02 AM Bhargavi Ananth <bhargavi_ananth@ieee.org> wrote:
Dear Dr. Argiropoulos,
Thanks for your quick response and feedback. We updated our funding proposal based on the guidelines given by you.
Hope this is in line with your expectation. Please let me know if any more changes are required.
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Also attaching the account details as requested by you in a separate attachment.

Thanking You
Regards
Bhargavi Ananth
SPS Faculty Advisor
KSIT
Bangalore

On Wed, Feb 8, 2023 at 11:42 PM Theresa Argiropoulos <t.argiropoulos@ieee.org> wrote:
Dear Bhargavi,

Thank you for sending over the proposal.  I looked it over and will need a breakdown of how the funds will be spent
per activity.  Please note that if honorariums are being considered, they can not be provided to Section/Chapter
leadership. Volunteers should not be provided with any form of payment.  Let me know if you have any questions.

Funding from SPS is limited to US$500, so please keep that in mind when preparing your budget.  I would appreciate
it if you could share your banking details for when we are ready to send the funding.

Regards,
-Theresa

On Tue, Feb 7, 2023 at 10:56 PM Bhargavi Ananth <bhargavi_ananth@ieee.org> wrote:
Dear Dr. Argiropoulos,
With reference to my earlier mail, I am attaching the detailed budget plan for the year 2023 to avail $500 additional
fund for KSIT SPS Student Chapter growth. I hope the plan submitted is in line with your expectations. However
requesting you to go through the detailed plan and suggest me if any changes are necessary. 
This amount will motivate us to conduct many more events in future.
Thank You

Regards
Bhargavi Ananth
SPS Faculty Advisor
KSIT, Bangalore
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